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Abstract:- This study aimed to determine the instructional 

styles and differentiated instruction practices of public 

elementary school teachers in Cluster XIII, Davao City. 

This study utilized the descriptive-correlational design 

with one hundred fifty elementary school teachers, 

selected using stratified random sampling technique. In 

gathering data, the researcher adapted a survey 

questionnaire both for the instructional styles and school 

differentiated instruction practices. Ethical considerations 

were observed in data collection. The collated data were 

subjected to statistical tests such as mean, Pearson’s r and 

multiple linear regression. Findings showed that the extent 

of instructional styles of elementary teachers is very 

extensive, which means that their instructional styles is 

always observed. The extent of differentiated instruction 

practices of elementary school teachers is very extensive, 

which means that their differentiated instruction practices 

is always observed. There was a moderate significant 

relationship between instructional styles and 

differentiated instruction practices. The domains of 

instructional styles that significantly influenced the 

differentiated instruction practices were modeling and 

delegating. With this, the Department of Education may 

allocate sufficient budget to ensure that schools have the 

resources they need to successfully implement 

differentiated education. This can provide access to a wide 

range of instructional materials, technology, and support 

workers to help fulfill varied learning needs. 

 

Keywords:- Differentiated Instruction Practices, Instructional 

Styles, Modeling, Delegating, Elementary School Teachers. 

 

I. INTRODUCTION 

 

Teaching in primary education is getting more 

challenging as pupils populations become more culturally, 

socially, and academically diverse, as the purpose of primary 
education is to promote meaningful and engaging learning to 

build students the right foundation of knowledge and skills. 

However, in public schools it is observed that pupils 

nowadays are passive learners. Majority of teachers consider 

ways to improve student performance standards and their 

ability to meet demands for increased competency. Unaware 

of the different learning preferences of their learners, teachers 

are prone to instruct in a way that limits students from 

producing their best performance, hence the quality of 

instruction is compromised. With this, differentiated 

instruction (DI) is practiced and implemented in many schools 

to address the issue.  

 
As students differ widely in nature, it was found that 

differentiated instruction is one of the right ways in teaching 

and learning methods in mathematics class in South Africa. 

Progress rates may differ in the same group because of 

differences in student cognitive development, instructional 

strategies, and teaching materials that all have a strong impact 

on academic performance (Pham, 2019). Kim, Jorg, and 

Klassen (2019) found that differentiated instruction was 

positively associated with mastery goals and self-efficacy of 

learners in science classrooms in Spain, which in turn led to 

better science achievement outcomes. However, though many 
teachers were aware of DI and its potential benefits, few were 

implementing it consistently and effectively in their 

classrooms.  

 

In the Philippines, differentiated instruction has been 

widely advocated as a promising approach to improve 

learning outcomes in different subjects, however there are still 

debates and questions regarding its effectiveness, such as the 

complexity and challenges associated with implementing in 

science classrooms and the need for further empirical 

investigation to determine its efficacy (Ramos & Lasaten, 

2020). Similarly, the study of Kim and Lee (2021) proved that 
differentiated instruction required significant effort and time 

from the teacher and posed challenges related to assessment 

and curriculum alignment. Though different trainings are 

provided by the Department of Education and other non-

government organizations, teachers are still hesitant to utilized 

this type of instruction due to lack of resources, limited 

technical assistance, and large class sizes, which made it 

difficult to implement differentiated instruction effectively 

(Canlas & Mabborang, 2021).  

 

A study that investigated the implementation of 
differentiated instruction in Davao del Sur is the work of 

Baylon and Chua (2018). They found that DI was effective in 

enhancing student learning performance, particularly in terms 

of critical thinking and problem-solving skills. Conversely, 

they also found that the implementation of DI required 

significant investment in teacher training, curriculum 

development, and instructional resources. This result is 

similar to the finding of Patindol and Rivera (2021) who 

explored the factors that influence the implementation of 

differentiated instruction in CARAGA Region and they 
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revealed that teachers faced several challenges in 

implementing differentiated instruction, including lack of 

resources, time constraints, and limited training opportunities. 

 

While differentiated instruction (DI) has been 

implemented in the Philippine education system, research on 

its effectiveness in the Division of Davao City is limited. 

Several authors have examined DI implementation in the 
Philippines as a whole, but research specifically focused in 

Davao City is scarce. One potential research gap in DI 

implementation in the Division of Davao City is the lack of 

empirical studies that investigate the factors that facilitate or 

hinder the implementation of DI. For example, it has been 

proved that there are unique challenges that hinder DI 

implementation in this division, such as limited resources or 

lack of teacher training. However, investigating other factors, 

for instance some teachers attributes, can help identify 

strategies to improve DI implementation. This could involve 

examining the instructional styles of teachers towards the 

approach. It is worth noting that the implementation of 
differentiated instruction requires significant training and 

support for teachers, as well as a commitment from school 

administrators and policymakers to prioritize its use. 

Therefore, if differentiated instruction is not currently being 

used in the Division of Davao City, it may be necessary to 

develop a comprehensive plan for introducing and supporting 

the approach in order to promote equitable and inclusive 

education in the division. 

 

II. METHOD 

 
This study utilized quantitative research design as it 

encompasses a range of methods concerned with the 

systematic investigation of social phenomena, using statistical 

or numerical data, involving measurement and assumes that 

the phenomenon under study can be measured (Walker, 2005 

as cited in Kandel, 2020). Creswell (2008) as cited in Baker 

(2017) mentioned that quantitative design sets out to gather 

data using measurement, to analyze this data for trends and 

relationships and to verify the measurements made. Moreover, 

it often sued to look at causal relationships, but they can also 

be used to look associations or relationship between variables. 

In this study, this kind of design is appropriate to use because 
its purpose is to determine the relationship between 

instructional styles and differentiated instruction practices of 

elementary school teachers. The quantitative part of this study 

was a suitable way for gathering the information required to 

ask the target respondents questions. The questionnaires 

chosen was the foundation for data collecting. 

 

Specifically, this study utilized the descriptive-

correlational design to explain the relationship between two or 

more variables without making any claims about cause and 

effect. It includes collecting and analyzing data on at least two 
variables to see if there is a link between them (Creswell, 

2012 as cited in Acebes-Sánchez, Diez-Vega and Rodriguez-

Romo, 2019). In this design, Akinlua and Haan (2019) 

highlighted that the data is collected to explain the variables 

of interest and figure out how they relate. The main goal is to 

give a full account of the variables and how they are related 

without changing them or assuming that one thing causes 

another. In this study, descriptive design was employed to 

measure the extents of instructional styles and differentiated 

instruction practices of public elementary school teachers in 
Cluster XIII, Division of Davao City. Furthermore, a 

correlational design was employed to assess the relationship 

between instructional styles and differentiated instruction 

practice, as well as to determine the domain of instructional 

styles (expertise, formal authority, modeling, facilitating and 

delegating) that may influence the differentiated instruction 

practices of public elementary school teachers. 

 

III. RESULT AND DISCUSSION 

 

This study aimed to determine the extents of 

instructional styles and differentiated instruction practices of 
public elementary school teachers in Cluster XIII, Division of 

Davao City during the school year 2023-2024. Specifically, 

this study aimed to determine if significant relationship exists 

between the instructional styles and differentiated instruction 

practices of public elementary school teachers. Moreover, this 

study sought to determine which domains of instructional 

styles significantly influenced the differentiated instruction 

practices of public elementary school teachers. This study 

utilized the descriptive-correlational design to determine the 

extents of instructional styles and differentiated instruction 

practices and if they are significantly related. The researcher 
used adopted survey questionnaires to collect the necessary 

data. Data collection involved strict compliance of ethical 

considerations. To analyze the data collected, mean, Pearson's 

r, and multiple linear regression were used. 

 

 Results of the Analysis Revealed the Following: 

The extent of instructional styles is very extensive. This 

means that the instructional styles of public elementary school 

teachers in Cluster XIII, Division of Davao City is always 

observed. 

 

The extent of differentiated instruction practices is very 
extensive. This means that the differentiated instruction 

practices of public elementary school teachers in Cluster XIII, 

Division of Davao City is always observed. 

 

The result also shows that there is a significant positive 

relationship between the instructional styles and differentiated 

instruction practices of public elementary school teachers. 

Moreover, the degree of the relationship is moderate. This 

means that when the instructional styles of public elementary 

school teachers in Cluster XIII, Division of Davao City is 

always observed, they would have high differentiated 
instruction practices. 

 

https://doi.org/10.38124/ijisrt/IJISRT24MAY1960
http://www.ijisrt.com/


Volume 9, Issue 5, May – 2024                                                   International Journal of Innovative Science and Research Technology 

ISSN No:-2456-2165                                                                                                    https://doi.org/10.38124/ijisrt/IJISRT24MAY1960 

 

 

IJISRT24MAY1960                                                               www.ijisrt.com                         1206 

Lastly, the result of the regression analysis shows that 

modeling and delegating are the domains of instructional 

styles that influenced the differentiated instruction practices of 

public elementary school teachers in Cluster XIII, Division of 

Davao City. 

 

The instructional style of public elementary school 

teachers is very extensive. This may result in enhanced 
learners’ engagement. Learners in public elementary schools 

are likely to have a thorough and comprehensive learning 

experience. Teachers who use a variety of teaching styles and 

interactive activities are more likely to engage students and 

create a positive learning environment. 

 

IV. CONCLUSION 

 

The differentiated instruction practices of public 

elementary school teachers is very extensive. This indicates 

that teachers tailor their teaching styles to the unique learning 

demands of individual learners. This can lead to more 
personalized learning experiences that address different 

learning styles, talents, and preferences. 

 

The extent of differentiated instruction practices of 

public elementary school teachers in Cluster XIII would 

depend on their instructional styles. When the instructional 

style is high, their differentiated instruction practices would 

also increase. Teachers who are actively involved in 

instruction are more likely to recognize and respond to their 

learners' unique needs using differentiated practices. 

 
Moreover, it is evident that those elementary school 

teachers who highly observed modeling and delegating are 

their instructional styles would always manifest a high 

differentiated instruction practices. If these teachers 

consistently model differentiated instruction and act as 

delegators, learners may internalize these approaches and 

develop an understanding of how to learn and work in diverse 

ways, and empower learners’ autonomy and self-directed 

learning.  

 

REFERENCES 

 
[1]. Abalon, M. J. F. (2018). Effects of technology 

differentiation on the Science achievement of Grade 9 

students. Asia Pacific Journal of Multidisciplinary 

Research, 6(4), 107-115. 

[2]. Acebes-Sánchez, J., Diez-Vega, I., & Rodriguez-Romo, 

G. (2019). Physical activity among spanish 

undergraduate students: A descriptive correlational 

study. International Journal of Environmental Research 

and Public Health, 16(15), 2770. 

[3]. Akinlua, S., & Haan, P. (2019). Comparing and 

contrasting descriptive designs: Observational studies, 
correlational research, developmental design and survey 

research. Journal of Quantitative Studies. 

[4]. Alano, A. L., & Tan, G. (2019). Impact of differentiated 

instruction using flexible grouping on Science 

achievement of Grade 10 students in the Philippines. 

Asia Pacific Journal of Multidisciplinary Research, 7(4), 

42-49. 

[5]. Alhassan, M. R., & Osman, K. (2019). The effect of 

process differentiated instruction on students' academic 

achievement in Senior High School Biology in Ghana. 
Journal of Education and Practice, 10(17), 56-63. 

[6]. Allen, R. (2018). The relationship between learning style 

and teaching style of secondary teachers in south central 

Kansas. Unpublished doctoral dissertation. Kansas State 

University, Manhattan, KS. and the use of learning 

strategies in teaching English. Eralingua: Jurnal 

Pendidikan Bahasa Asing dan Sastra. 2(2). 

[7]. Almazroa, H., & Alshehri, F. (2021). Effects of flexible 

grouping on students' Science achievement in a Saudi 

Secondary School. Journal of Educational Research and 

Practice, 11(1), 68-80. 

[8]. Alsadoon, N., & Al-Fraihat, D. (2019). Effects of 
content differentiation on student motivation and 

learning outcomes in a Biology course. Journal of 

Educational Technology Systems, 47(1), 61-78. 

[9]. Amirrudin, M., Nasution, K., & Supahar, S. (2021). 

Effect of variability on Cronbach alpha reliability in 

research practice. Jurnal Matematika, Statistika dan 

Komputasi, 17(2), 223-230. 

[10]. Ancho, I. V., & Arrieta, G. S. (2021). Filipino teacher 

professional development in the new normal. Education 

and Self Development, 16 (3), 25-43. 

[11]. Angeles, G. L., & Lumactod, R. S. (2019). Effects of 
differentiated instruction on the academic performance 

of students with hearing impairment in Science. Journal 

of Research in Special Educational Needs, 19(1), 64-73.  

[12]. Bahzar, M. (2019). Authentic leadership in madrassas: 

Asserting Islamic values in teacher performance. Journal 

of Social Studies Education Research, 10(1), 259-284. 

[13]. Baker, C. (2017). Quantitative research designs: 

Experimental, quasi-experimental, and 

descriptive. Evidence-based practice: An integrative 

approach to research, administration, and practice, 155-

183. Retrieved August 20, 2023 from 

http://samples.jblearning.com/9781284101539/ 
9781284101539_CH06_Drummond.pdf.  

[14]. Barzallo, R. (2019). School Principals as Role Models 

for Professional Development. Retrieved August 17, 

2023 from https://bit.ly/3ZhKOBb. 

[15]. Baylon, M. A. R., & Chua, R. Y. J. (2018). 

Implementing differentiated instruction in a Science 

classroom in the Philippines: A case study. Asia-Pacific 

Education Researcher, 24(3), 491-500. 

https://doi.org/10.1007/s40299-015-0259-8 

[16]. Bell, R.L., Smetana, L.K., & Binns, I.C. (2018). 

Simplifying Inquiry Instruction: Assessing the Inquiry 
Level of Classroom Activities. The Science Teacher, 72 

(7), 30-33. 

https://doi.org/10.38124/ijisrt/IJISRT24MAY1960
http://www.ijisrt.com/
https://doi.org/10.1007/s40299-015-0259-8


Volume 9, Issue 5, May – 2024                                                   International Journal of Innovative Science and Research Technology 

ISSN No:-2456-2165                                                                                                    https://doi.org/10.38124/ijisrt/IJISRT24MAY1960 

 

 

IJISRT24MAY1960                                                               www.ijisrt.com                         1207 

[17]. Berkova, K., Boruvková, J., Frendlovska, D., Krplek, P., 

& Melas, D. (2020). Learning style preferences of 

university and college students. Problems of Education 

in the 21st Century, 78(4), 486. 

[18]. Blazar, D., & Kraft, M.A. (2017). Teacher and Teaching 

Effects on Students’ Attitudes and Behaviors. 

Educational Evaluation and Policy Analysis, 39 (1), 146 

- 170. 
[19]. Blomgren, C. (2017). Current trends and perspectives in 

the K-12 Canadian blended and online classroom: 

Optimizing K-12 education through online and blended 

learning. IGI Global, 74-92. 

[20]. Bogen, E. C., Schlendorf, C. P., Nicolino, P. A., & 

Morote, E. S. (2019). Instructional Strategies in 

Differentiated Instruction for Systemic Change. Journal 

for Leadership and Instruction, 18(2), 18-22. Retrieved 

August 19, 2023 from 

https://files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/EJ1235692.pdf. 

[21]. Bohren, A. (2019). Teaching Styles: Everything you 

need to know about teaching methods and strategies. 
Retrieved August 20, 2023 from 

https://blog.cognifit.com/ teaching-styles/. 

[22]. Brady, R. (2019). Facilitator Spotlight. Retrieved on 

August 5, 2023 from https://bit.ly/3GVwOWu. 

[23]. Campbell, A., & Campbell, R. (2018). Challenges and 

Benefits of Differentiated Instruction in Science 

classrooms. Journal of Science Education and 

Technology, 27(3), 239-250. 

[24]. Canlas, M. L. R., & Mabborang, C. V. (2021). The 

impact of differentiated instruction on academic 

performance and engagement of High School students. 
Educational Research International, 2021, 1-10. doi: 

10.1155/2021/6647899. 

[25]. Caspari-Sadeghi, S., & Konig, J. (2018). On the 

Adequacy of Expert Teachers: From Practical 

Convenience to Psychological Reality. International 

Journal of Higher Education, 7(5), 1-19. 

[26]. Chen, J., & Guo, W. (2020). Emotional intelligence can 

make a difference: The impact of principals’ emotional 

intelligence on teaching strategy mediated by 

instructional leadership. Educational Management 

Administration & Leadership, 48(1), 82-105. 

[27]. Chetty, N. D. S., Handayani, L., Sahabudin, N. A., Ali, 
Z., Hamzah, N., Rahman, N. S. A., & Kasim, S. (2019). 

Learning Styles and Teaching Styles Determine 

Students' Academic Performances. International Journal 

of Evaluation and Research in Education, 8(4), 610-615. 

[28]. Christodoulou, D. (2017). Making good progress? The 

future of assessment for learning. Oxford: Oxford 

University Press. 

[29]. Copkova, R. (2020). Perceived Teachers’ Justice and 

Perceived Teachers’ Authority. Acta Educationis 

Generalis, 10 (3), 135 - 150. 

 
 

[30]. Cruz, E. M., & Tungpalan, M. A. (2021). The impact of 

technology differentiation on the science achievement 

and retention of grade 8 students. International Journal 

of Emerging Technologies in Learning, 16(6), 111-123. 

[31]. Curtin, E. (2021). Instructional Styles Used by Regular 

Classroom Teachers while Teaching Recently 

Mainstreamed ESL Students: Six Urban Middle School 

Teachers in Texas Share Their Experiences and 
Perceptions. Multicultural Education, 12(4), 36. 

[32]. Davies, C.A. (2021). Teachers and administrators need 

to be strong role models. A+ Teachers' Interview Edge 

(2nd ed). Retrieved August 6, 2023 from 

https://www.learnersedge.com/. 

[33]. Decena, A. D., & Robles, R. M. (2018). The Effect of 

Process Differentiation on the Academic Performance of 

Grade 8 Students in Science. Asia Pacific Journal of 

Education, Arts and Sciences, 5(3), 38-45. 

[34]. De Mesa, L., Tandog, M. L., & Blando, A. C. (2022). 

Effects of differentiated instruction on the Science 

achievement of Grade 9 students. Asia-Pacific Journal of 
Multidisciplinary Research, 4(1), 1-9.  

[35]. Desyatova, Y. (2020). When inquiry is seen as resistance 

to change: expert teachers’ experiences with the 

implementation of portfolio-based language assessment 

(PBLA). Critical Inquiry in Language Studies, 17(1), 

42-63. 

[36]. Deunk M. I., Smale-Jacobse A. E., de Boer H., Doolaard 

S., Bosker R. J. (2018). Effective differentiation 

practices: a systematic review and meta-analysis of 

studies on the cognitive effects of differentiation 

practices in primary education. Educational Research 
Review, 24 (2), 31–54. 

[37]. Dikkartın Ovez, F. T., & Uyangor, S. M. (2019). The 

Effect of the Match between the Learning and Teaching 

Styles of Secondary School Mathematics Teachers on 

Students’ Achievement. Retrieved August 13, 2023 from 

https://rb.gy/89ukfl. 

[38]. Dineen, R. & Niu, W. (2018). The effectiveness of 

western creative teaching methods in China: An action 

research approach. Psychology of Aesthetics, Creativity, 

and the Arts, 2 (1), 42-52. 

[39]. Elena, B., Irina, G., Menshikov, P., Tatiana, Z., & 

Mariam, A. (2018, September). The ability to learn and 
ability to teach: learning and teaching styles. 

In International Conference on the Theory and Practice 

of Personality Formation in Modern Society 

(ICTPPFMS 2018) (pp. 146-153). Atlantis Press. 

[40]. Finefter-Rosenbluh, I., Ryan, T., & Barnes, M. (2021). 

The impact of student perception surveys on teachers’ 

practice: Teacher resistance and struggle in student 

voice-based assessment initiatives of effective 

teaching. Teaching and Teacher Education, 106 (1), 1-

13. 

 
 

https://doi.org/10.38124/ijisrt/IJISRT24MAY1960
http://www.ijisrt.com/
https://rb.gy/89ukfl


Volume 9, Issue 5, May – 2024                                                   International Journal of Innovative Science and Research Technology 

ISSN No:-2456-2165                                                                                                    https://doi.org/10.38124/ijisrt/IJISRT24MAY1960 

 

 

IJISRT24MAY1960                                                               www.ijisrt.com                         1208 

[41]. Galevska, N. A. & Pesic, M. (2018). Assessing children 

with special educational needs in the inclusive 

classrooms. Retrieved from August 6, 2023 

https://bit.ly/3QsAmTz. 

[42]. Gay, G. (2019). Examining faculty perception of their 

readiness to teach. Online Learning, 23(3), 97-119. 

[43]. Ginja, T. G., & Chen, X. (2020). Teacher Educators' 

Perspectives and Experiences towards Differentiated 
Instruction. International Journal of Instruction, 13(4), 

781-798. Retrieved August 19, 2023 from 

https://files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/EJ1270682.pdf. 

[44]. Gonzales, R. (2022). Delegator teaching style. Colorado 

State University. Retrieved August 16, 2023 from 

https://binged.it/3QDpguT. 

[45]. Gonzales, M. M., & Jackson, I. (2020). Going the 

Distance: What School Administrators Can Learn from 

One-to-One Laptop Schools. Journal of School 

Administration Research and Development, 5 (1), 55-60. 

[46]. Grasha, A. F. (2018). Learning styles: The journey from 

Greenwich Observatory to the college classroom. 
Improving College and University Teaching, 32 (1), 46-

53. 

[47]. Guney, Z. (2019). Visual literacy and visualization in 

instructional design and technology for learning 

environments. European Journal of Contemporary 

Education, 8(1), 103-117. 

[48]. Harlen, W. (2022). Inquiry-based learning in science and 

mathematics. Retrieved August 16, 2023 from 

https://rb.gy/06xv3w. 

[49]. Heredia, B. (2021). General education teachers’ 

perspective of differentiated instruction in the inclusive 
classroom. Unpublished Thesis Presented to the Faculty 

of California State Polytechnic University, Pomona. 

Retrieved August 11, 2023 from 

https://scholarworks.calstate.edu/downloads/ c247dz50z. 

[50]. Hong, J., Lee, H. J., & Jeong, S. (2022). Effects of 

differentiated instruction on science learning outcomes 

of students with autism spectrum disorder. International 

Journal of Science Education, 44(1), 80-98. Retrieved 

August 11, 2023 from 

https://doi.org/10.1080/09500693.2021.1994145. 

[51]. Howell, D. (2020). What does a teacher do? Teachers 

Are Role Model.  Granite Falls School District of 
Washington State. Retrieved August 11, 2023 from 

https://teach.com/what/teachers-are-role-models/. 

[52]. Husin, S. (2017). Matching Teaching Styles with 

Students’ Learning Styles (A Survey of Indonesian 

Students’ Habits of Learning). Retrieved August 4, 2023 

from https://rb.gy/opkrcf. 

[53]. Iliyasu, R., & Etikan, I. (2021). Comparison of quota 

sampling and stratified random sampling. Biometrics & 

Biostatistics International Journal, 10(1), 24-27. 

Retrieved August 20, 2023 from 

https://www.researchgate.net/profile/RufaiIliyasu/public
ation/354054682_Comparison_of_quota_sampling_and_

stratified_random_sampling/links/6121733b0c2bfa282a

603efe/Comparison-of-quota-sampling-and-stratified-

random-sampling.pdf. 

[54]. Johnson, K., & Olanoff, D. (2020). Using transformative 

learning theory to help prospective teachers learn 

mathematics that they already “know”. The Mathematics 

Enthusiast, 17(2), 725-769. 

[55]. Kamenarac, O. (2021). Problematizing constructions of 

‘expert teachers’ and ‘vulnerable children in New 
Zealand Early Childhood. International Journal of Early 

Years Education, 1-16. Retrieved August 13, 2023 from 

https://www. 

tandfonline.com/doi/abs/10.1080/09669760.2021.18926

02. 

[56]. Kandel, B. (2020). Qualitative Versus Quantitative 

Research. Journal of Product Innovation 

Management, 32(5), 658.  

[57]. Karacabey, M. F. (2020). School principal support in 

teacher professional development. International Journal 

of Educational Leadership and Management, 9 (1), 54-

75.  
[58]. Karimi-Aghdam, S. (2018). Zone of proximal 

development (ZPD) as an emergent system: A dynamic 

systems theory perspective. Integrative Psychological 

and Behavioral Science, 51, 76-93. 

[59]. Kazemi, A. & Soleimani, N. (2018). On Iranian EFL 

teachers' dominant teaching style at private language 

centers. International Journal of Language Learning and 

Applied Linguistics World (IJLLALW), 4(1), 193-202. 

[60]. Keiler, L.S. (2018). Teachers’ roles and identities in 

student-centered classrooms. International Journal of 

Stem Education, 5 (34), 1-20. 
[61]. Kim, L. E., Jorg, V., & Klassen, R. M. (2019). A meta-

analysis of the effects of teacher personality on teacher 

effectiveness and burnout. Educational Psychology 

Review, 31(1), 163-195. Retrieved July 13, 2023 from 

https://doi.org/10.1007/s10648-018-9458-2. 

[62]. Kim, J., & Lee, S. (2021). The impact of differentiated 

instruction on motivation in South Korea. Educational 

Studies, 47(1), 105-120. 

[63]. Koch, K. R. (2017). A Conversation with Dr. Rita Dunn. 

Institute for Learning Styles Journal, 1. Retrieved 

August 16, 2023 from https://tinyurl.com/4ye4r4xx. 

[64]. Lacambra, M. R., Diaz, J. B., & Reyes, M. L. (2018). 
The challenges and benefits of implementing 

differentiated instruction in science classes. Asia Pacific 

Journal of Multidisciplinary Research, 6(3), 127-134. 

[65]. Lahtero, T. J., Ahtiainen, R., & Lang, N. (2019). Finnish 

principals: Leadership training and views on distributed 

leadership. Educational Research and Reviews, 14 (10), 

340-348. 

[66]. Lamatokan, A. (2018). Students’ perception toward 

teachers’ teaching styles and the use of learning 

strategies in teaching English. Eralingua: Jurnal 

Pendidikan Bahasa Asing dan Sastra, 2(2), 41-46.  
 

https://doi.org/10.38124/ijisrt/IJISRT24MAY1960
http://www.ijisrt.com/
https://binged.it/3QDpguT
https://doi.org/10.1080/09500693.2021.1994145


Volume 9, Issue 5, May – 2024                                                   International Journal of Innovative Science and Research Technology 

ISSN No:-2456-2165                                                                                                    https://doi.org/10.38124/ijisrt/IJISRT24MAY1960 

 

 

IJISRT24MAY1960                                                               www.ijisrt.com                         1209 

[67]. Llagas, R. R., & Ubaldo, K. S. (2017). Effectiveness of 

differentiated instruction in enhancing the conceptual 

understanding of physics concepts of college students. 

Asia-Pacific Education Researcher, 26(5-6), 293-302. 

[68]. Lockette, T. (2019). UF study: Contrasting teaching 

styles in U.S.-China classrooms may influence students’ 

learning preferences - News - University of Florida. 

Retrieved August 20, 2023 from https://rb.gy/vtdwfe. 
[69]. Lowman, J. (2019). Mastering the Techniques of 

Teaching. Second Edition., 1995. Retrieved August 14, 

2023 from https://eric.ed.gov/?id=ED387051. 

[70]. Lunsford, K. J. (2017). Challenges to Implementing 

Differentiated Instruction in Middle School Classrooms 

with Mixed Skill Levels (PhD Thesis). Walden 

University. Retrieved August 11, 2023 from 

https://scholarworks.waldenu. edu/dissertations. 

[71]. Malacapay, M. C. (2019). Differentiated Instruction in 

Relation to Pupils' Learning Style. International Journal 

of Instruction, 12(4), 625-638. Retrieved August 19, 

2023 from 
https://files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/EJ1230097.pdf. 

[72]. Marban, J. M., & Mulenga, E. M. (2019). Pre-Service 

Primary Teachers' Teaching Styles and Attitudes 

towards the Use of Technology in Mathematics 

Classrooms. International Electronic Journal of 

Mathematics Education, 14(2), 253-263. 

[73]. Mariano, A. R., Sunga, R. E., & Talusan, E. F. (2020). 

Effects of content differentiation on the academic 

achievement of students in science. International 

Journal of Humanities and Social Science Research, 

4(1), 1-9. 
[74]. Mazarin, J. (2021). Facilitator of Learning: Definition & 

Concept. Retrieved August 20, 2023 from 

https://study.com/academy/lesson/facilitator-of-learning-

definition-lesson-quiz.html. 

[75]. McConnell, M., Boyer, J., Montplaisir, L. M., Arneson, 

J. B., Harding, R. L., Farlow, B., & Offerdahl, E. G. 

(2021). Interpret with caution: COPUS instructional 

styles may not differ in terms of practices that support 

student learning. CBE—Life Sciences Education, 20(2), 

ar26. 

[76]. Mcleod, S. (2023). Constructivism Learning Theory & 

Philosophy Of Education. Child Psychology and 
Development. Retrieved August 19, 2023 from 

https://www.simplypsychology.org/constructivism.html. 

[77]. Melesse, T. (2021). Differentiated instruction: 

Perceptions, practices and challenges of primary school 

teachers. Science, Technology and Arts Research 

Journal, 4(3), 253-264.  

[78]. Motlhaka, H. (2018). Paulo Freire’s Critical Pedagogy in 

the Classroom: Promotion of Critica Thinking in South 

African English First Additional Language (FAL) 

Students, International Journal of Educational Sciences, 

13:1, 65-71, DOI: 10.1080/09751122.2018.11890441. 
 

[79]. Nalipay, M. J. N., Mordeno, I. G., Semilla, J. R. B., & 

Frondozo, C. E. (2019). Implicit beliefs about teaching 

ability, teacher emotions, and teaching satisfaction. The 

Asia-Pacific Education Researcher, 28 (4), 313-325. 

[80]. Nie, Y., & Lau, S. (2018). Content differentiation in 

science instruction: A meta-analysis of the effects on 

students' understanding and interest. International 

Journal of Science Education, 40(2), 215-230. 
[81]. Noor Abdul Aziz, R. (2022). Adopt personal model of 

teaching in classroom.   School of Education, Universiti 

Utara Malaysia. Retrieved August 14, 2023 from 

https://www.nst.com.my/opinion/letters/2022/04/785690

/adopt-person al-model-teaching-classroom. 

[82]. Pang, Y. L., & Lee, K. T. (2019). A case study of 

differentiated instruction in a Singapore primary school 

science classroom. Asia-Pacific Science Education, 5(1), 

4. Retrieved August 12, 2023 from 

https://doi.org/10.1186/s41029-019-0025-y. 

[83]. Paniagua, A. (2018). Why pedagogy matters for 

innovative teaching. Retrieved from 
https://bit.ly/3CDVbFV. 

[84]. Patindol, G. R., & Rivera, E. M. (2021). Implementation 

of differentiated instruction in the CARAGA region: 

Exploring the factors that influence its use. International 

Journal of Education and Research, 9(2), 185-198. doi: 

10.24815/ijer.v9i2.24302. 

[85]. Petrík, S. (2019). Teachers authority as a one of the most 

important factor of school reform. In 6th SWS 

International Scientific Conferences on social sciences 

2019, 485-492. Retrieved August 20, 2023 from 

https://www.research gate.net/profile/Stefan-Petrik-
2/publication/339242501_Teachers_authority 

_as_a_one_of_the_most_important_factor_of_school_re

form/links/6014a53545851517ef2697a8/Teacher-s-

authority-as-a-one-of-the-most-important -factor-of-

school-reform.pdf. 

[86]. Pezaro, C. (2017). The role of a teacher and the purpose 

of education. Retrieved August 19, 2023 from 

https://rb.gy/runj0w. 

[87]. Pham, H. L. (2019). Differentiated instruction and the 

need to integrate teaching and practice. Journal of 

College Teaching & Learning (TLC), 9(1), 13-20. 

[88]. Pietsch, M., & Tulowitzki, P. (2020). Disentangling 
school leadership and its ties to instructional practices–

an empirical comparison of various leadership 

styles. School effectiveness and school 

improvement, 28(4), 629-649. 

[89]. RA 10173. Data Privacy Act of 2012. National Privacy 

Commission. Retrieved August 20, 2023 from 

https://privacy.gov.ph/data-privacy-act/#:~:text=% 

5BREPUBLIC%20ACT%20NO.,COMMISSION%2C%

20AND%20FOR%20OTHER%20PURPOSES. 

 

 
 

https://doi.org/10.38124/ijisrt/IJISRT24MAY1960
http://www.ijisrt.com/
https://eric.ed.gov/?id=ED387051
https://doi.org/10.1186/s41029-019-0025-y


Volume 9, Issue 5, May – 2024                                                   International Journal of Innovative Science and Research Technology 

ISSN No:-2456-2165                                                                                                    https://doi.org/10.38124/ijisrt/IJISRT24MAY1960 

 

 

IJISRT24MAY1960                                                               www.ijisrt.com                         1210 

[90]. Rahimi, M. & Asadollahi, F. (2017). Teaching Styles of 

Iranian EFL Teachers: Do Gender, Age, and Experience 

Make a Difference? International Journal of English 

Linguistics, 2(2), 157-163. 

[91]. Ramos, L. A., & Lasaten, R. C. S. (2020). Effect of 

differentiated instruction on students’ level of 

engagement and performance in English. The Asian ESP 

Journal, 16(2.2), 69-89. 
[92]. Rathmann K., Herke M., Hurrelmann K. & Richter M. 

(2018) Perceived class climate and school-aged 

children's life satisfaction: The role of the learning 

environment in classrooms. Retrieved August 19, 2023 

from https://doi.org/10.1371/journal.pone.0189335.  

[93]. Razak, N. A., Ahmad, F., & Shah, P. M. (2017). 

Perceived and Preferred Teaching Styles (Methods) of 

English for Specific Purposes (ESP) Students. Retrieved 

August 8, 2023 from https://rb.gy/lrchna. 

[94]. Republic Act No. 9155, Series of 2001. An Act 

Instituting a Framework of Governance for Basic 

Education, Establishing Authority and Accountability, 
Renaming the Department of Education, Culture and 

Sports as the Department of Education, and For Other 

Purposes. Retrieved August 10, 2023 from 

https://files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/ED590796.pdf. 

[95]. Reyes, R. C. R. (2019). A study on students’ perceived 

and preferred teaching styles in Philippine 

politics. Journal of Advances in Humanities and Social 

Sciences, 5(6), 247-253. 

[96]. Sabado, R. R., & Allan, O. (2019). Junior and senior 

technical vocational education teachers’ performance 

and teaching styles: A comparison. International Journal 
of Latest Research in Humanities and Social 

Science, 2(6), 32-42. 

[97]. Sahin, F. (2021). The Role of School Administrators in 

Organizational Learning Processes. Research in 

Educational Administration and Leadership. 6 (4), 833-

868.  

[98]. Schwartz, M. (2018). Expert learning for law students. 

University of the Pacific, McGeorge School of Law. 

Retrieved August 20, 2023 from 

https://scholarlycommons.pacific.edu/facultybooks/23/. 

[99]. Serquina, R. J., & Apao, D. D. (2018). Effects of 

differentiated instruction on the science achievement of 
high school students. Journal of Education and Practice, 

6(3), 100-105.  

[100]. Smale-Jacobse, A. E., Meijer, A., Helms-Lorenz, M., 

& Maulana, R. (2019). Differentiated instruction in 

secondary education: A systematic review of research 

evidence. Frontiers in psychology, 10, 2366. 

[101]. Stahnke, R., & Blomeke, S. (2021). Novice and expert 

teachers’ noticing of classroom management in whole-

group and partner work activities: Evidence from 

teachers' gaze and identification of events. Learning 

and Instruction, 74 (1). Retrieved August 8, 2023 from 
https://www.science 

direct.com/science/article/abs/pii/S095947522100023. 

[102]. Strawhacker, A., Lee, M., & Bers, M. U. (2018). 

Teaching tools, teachers’ rules: Exploring the impact 

of teaching styles on young children’s programming 

knowledge in ScratchJr. International Journal of 

Technology and Design Education, 28, 347-376. 

Retrieved August 17, 2023 from https:// 

ase.tufts.edu/DevTech/publications/Strawhacker_Lee_

Bers_Teaching%20Tools%20Teachers%20Rules.pdf. 
[103]. Subardiaga, R. A., & Calma, E. F. (2021). Product 

differentiation in assessing students’ understanding of 

cellular biology in a Philippine college. Journal of 

Baltic Science Education, 20(4), 586-600. 

[104]. Subban, P. (2018). Differentiated instruction: A 

research basis. International Education Journal, 7(7), 

935-947. 

[105]. Tejada, J. A. L., & Marasigan, R. M. (2018). Effect of 

flexible grouping on science achievement and 

motivation of grade 10 students in the Philippines. 

International Journal of Evaluation and Research in 

Education, 7(2), 220-226.  
[106]. Tongson, M.B., & Eslit, Ph.D., E.R. (2018). Teaching 

Styles and Language Performance: Towards a 

Development of an English Language Program. ERIC 

Institute of Education Sciences. Retrieved August 2, 

2023 from 

https://files.eric.ed.gov/fulltext/ED590796.pdf. 

[107]. Torres, A. M. R., & Gayeta, M. M. (2018). Effects of 

differentiated instruction on the critical thinking skills 

of students in the Philippines. International Journal of 

Instruction, 11(1), 215-230. 

[108]. Valencia, M. (2020). Modular Approach in Teaching 
Science 10. International Journal of Trend in Scientific 

Research and Development, 4(3), 99-106. Retrieved 

August 2, 2023 from https://www.ijtsrd.com/papers/ 

ijtsrd30318.pdf. 

[109]. Van Rensburg, M. E., & Adendorff, S. (2015). The 

effectiveness of differentiated instruction in the 

teaching of Science concepts to Grade 9 learners. 

South African Journal of Education, 35(4), 1-9. 

Retrieved August 4, 2023 from 

https://doi.org/10.15700/saje.v35n4a1185. 

[110]. Warren, L. L. (2021). The importance of teacher 

leadership skills in the classroom. Education Journal, 
10(1), 8-15. 

[111]. Winkley, D. (2018). Educational management and 

school leadership: an evolutionary perspective. In New 

Directions in Educational Leadership (pp. 205-219). 

Routledge. 

[112]. Wolff, C.E., Jarodzka, H., & Boshuizen, H. (2017). 

See and tell: Differences between expert and novice 

teachers’ interpretations of problematic classroom 

management events. Teaching and Teacher Education, 

66 (1), 295-308. 

 
 

https://doi.org/10.38124/ijisrt/IJISRT24MAY1960
http://www.ijisrt.com/
https://scholarlycommons.pacific.edu/facultybooks/23/
https://doi.org/10.15700/saje.v35n4a1185


Volume 9, Issue 5, May – 2024                                                   International Journal of Innovative Science and Research Technology 

ISSN No:-2456-2165                                                                                                    https://doi.org/10.38124/ijisrt/IJISRT24MAY1960 

 

 

IJISRT24MAY1960                                                               www.ijisrt.com                         1211 

[113]. Wong, A. M. (2019). Driving forces of master 

teachers’ research capability: Towards building a 

research culture in the division of Romblon, 

Philippines. International Journal of Advanced 

Research and Publications, 3 (7), 92-97. 

[114]. Wu, C. K. Y., Wan, S. W. Y., & Wong, Y. (2021). 

Exploring Hong Kong secondary school teachers’ 

teaching beliefs on differentiated instruction. Teaching 
for tomorrow today, 158. 

[115]. Xhomara, N. (2018). Influence of school leadership 

style on effective teaching and teacher-student 

interaction. Pedagogika, 132(4), 42-62. 

[116]. Yavuz, O. (2018). Exploring the impacts of school 

reforms on underrepresented urban students’ college 

persistence. Educational Research and Evaluation, 22 

(7), 354 - 373. 

https://doi.org/10.38124/ijisrt/IJISRT24MAY1960
http://www.ijisrt.com/

